
ACTIVIES OF HOME SCIENCE DEPARTMENT FOR THE SESSION 2020-21 

SL NO. DATE: 
Seminar/webinar 

Title of the 
seminar 

Name of the 
Resource 

person 

Brief report on seminar/ Webinar 

1.  21-10-2020 Promotive health 
and community 

Minati Panda, 

Assisstant prof. 
in Home 
science 

Dr. Minati Panda, resource person of the 
webinar delivered the topic briefly about 
the topic “History, origin, definitions, 
purpose, outcomes and approaches of 
health promotion. Puja Sah, students of 
5th semester also present a paper on this 
topic.  

2.  18-11-2020 

WEBINAR 

Importance of 
supplementing 
income for 
housewives 

 

Sunita Mishra, 
Reader in 
Home Science, 
Govt Womens; 
college, 
Sundergarh 

Madam discussed about the various ways 
of supplementing family income and also 
discussed why it is necessary for a house 
wives. She also enlightened that in which 
way housewives used this supplementing 
income as a assets to improve her own 
status in family and society.   

3.  08-12-2020 

WEBINAR 

Different 
programme and 
policies of govt. to 
prevent IMR and 
MMR 

Sunita Mishra, 
Sushilabati 
Govt womens’ 
college, 
Rourkela 

Madam enlightens various programmes 
and policies of government (Janani 
Surakhya Yojana, Ashas, Janani Sishu 
Suraksha Karyakram, Meternity welfare 
centers, Pradhan mantri surakshit 
Matrutwa Abhijan, Surakshit Matrutwa 
Aswasan, Home based neonatal care, 
Different programmes of ICDS, etc.) 

4.  12-03-2021 Food microbiology 
and Spoilage of 
food 

Nupur Agrawal, 
Lect. in Home 
science 

Mrs. Nupur Agrawal, Present this topic 
and give a brief knowledge about the 
causes of food spoilage and preventive 
measures to store the food for a longer 
period of time.  

She was also discussed about the different 
methods of food preservation. 

5.  12-04-2021 

SEMINAR 

Female foeticide ; 
A curse on future 

Mrs. Arati 
Panda, 

S.G. Womens’ 
college, 
Rourkela 

Arati madam enlightened the causes of 
female feticide and its adverse effects on 
future. She also discussed the importance 
of girls child for our home and society.  

 



  
 


